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Abstract 

 
The purpose of this study is to examine how the promotion of active participation and teamwork 
within the firm contribute to business success and consequently helps firms to gain a competitive 
advantage. Initially, the emphasis is placed on employee participation approach, its characteristics and 
its contribution to continuous improvement. The concept of teamwork and its basic characteristics are 
also analyzed for entrepreneurship reinforcement. Specifically, we argue that business units need to 
adjust their strategy and pursue strategic management practices, in order to exploit the beneficial 
potentials of employee involvement. In such a way they may achieve a sustainable competitive 
advantage.  The findings of this study are useful to top and middle level managers and policy makers.   
 
JEL Classification: L1, L26, J21. 
Keywords: Employee Participation, Team Work Performance, Entrepreneurship, Strategic 
Management, Competitive Advantage 
 
 
1. Introduction 
Researchers around the world acknowledge that entrepreneurship is a key driver of 
innovation that stimulates economic development and enhance sustainable growth for 
economic units (Davidsson et al, 2006; Audrestch & Thurik, 2000). Firms and organizations, 
in order to improve entrepreneurship in the new globalized era, need to survive and gain a 
competitive advantage against their competitors (Porter, 1987). A competitive advantage can 
be characterized as sustainable, when it embraces any tangible or intangible asset that 
discriminates a company among its rivals. As a consequence, firms may gain profits 
exceeding the average profitability of the sector. The company that establishes sustainable 
competitive advantage succeeds in gaining leadership characteristics against its competitors.  

Porter (1985) identifies two basic types of competitive advantage: a) cost advantage and b) 
differentiation advantage. These two characteristics may help modern enterprises to increase 
their efficiency and effectiveness so as to enhance overall performance, if are used properly 
by top level management. Specifically, firms enjoy competitive advantage when they are 
capable of obtaining similar benefits with their competitors at a lower cost (cost advantage) 
or deliver benefits exceeding those of competing products (differentiation advantage). Thus, a 
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competitive advantage enables firms to create superior value for their customers and superior 
profits for them.  

 Modern organizations, in order to support the mission statement in relation to business 
strategy, have to constantly take under consideration the major changes of the external 
environment, in their effort to identify possible opportunities and threats (Georgopoulos, 
2013). Assuming that the strategy implementation and formulation process can be 
characterized as “the two sides of the same coin” (Wheelen & Hunger, 2012), the changes of 
the external environment can be classified into five main factors: a) the treat of substitute 
products and services, b) the threat of new entrants, c) the bargaining power of customers, d) 
the bargaining power of suppliers and e) the level of existing rivalry in the industry (Porter, 
1979).   

Based on the above factors, a firm can enhance its entrepreneurship level, namely its ability 
to perceive new opportunities and bring innovative ideas to the market (Carree & Thurik, 
2003). It is worth emphasizing that when the entire workforce supports the overall strategy 
and the intermediate goals, firms may achieve strategic competitiveness and superior profits. 
Therefore, the new labor force practices should be applied as a source of contemporary 
competitive advantage, which enables firms to gain sustainable success for the future.  

The rest of this paper is organized as follows. In Section 2 we highlight the importance of 
employee participation approach and team work performance to achieve strategic 
management objectives. In Section 3 we describe the methodology applied followed by the 
well known competitive five forces model, firstly introduced by Porter (1980). In Section 4 
we discuss the main drivers that generate competitive advantage by the extensive use of 
employee participation and team work performance. Finally, in Section 5 we report the main 
concluding remarks of this study and encapsulate our main arguments. 

 
2. Employee Participation and Teamwork Performance  
 
2.1 Employee participation 
Employees can be regarded as the most powerful source of competitive advantage, which 
lead any firm to organizational excellence1. It is worth clarifying that the employees carry 
their own assets to businesses they participate in, by working together, rather than as 
independent contributors. By this way, the workforce can create more value for the 
organization (Mayo, 2001). In this study, emphasis is given to the importance of human 
resources management compared to the other competitive success factors (Pfeffer, 1994). 

On this basis, participation can be defined as the employees’ active involvement in planning 
and implementing a teamwork intervention (Hurrell, 2005). In this way, employee 
participation is linked with changes in procedures that the employees are involved with: a) 
making decisions about the team in which they wished to work, b) planning how they wished 
to work together in teams, c) planning the implementation of teams (the speed with which 
they took on additional areas of responsibility), d) defining initiatives to support team 
implementation, such as additional training and finally, e) evaluating the results by reflecting 
on the implementation in teams (Nielsen & Randall, 2012). 

In business theory there are several aspects of participation in an organization. The first 
aspect is related with the opportunity for employees to achieve their goals. The second refers 

1 http://www.refresher.com/!clbtalent.html 
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to the way of seeking new ideas by the employees, and the last aspect involves the 
assignment of responsibilities to employees (Gibson, Ivanchevich et al., 1992). 

Employee participation needs to be accompanied by actual changes in everyday work 
practices, if important outcomes, such as increases in job satisfaction and autonomy, are 
about to happen. Moreover, employee participation is linked with the involvement in 
planning and implementation of organizational change ranging from direct to indirect. 
Specifically, in the first category employees are directly involved in their every-day word 
activities, while in the second employees are represented by authorized fellows (Busck et al, 
2010; Nielsen & Randall, 2012).  

Most of the relevant studies examining participation point out that in the indirect participation 
employees’ involvement is higher, in the case of decision-making. This could be done by 
workers’ representatives, employee directors, worker unions and work councils. It is worth 
clarifying that the relevant decisions, which the above representatives take, are not directly 
applicable to everyday workers’ activities, but have great strategic importance to the 
organization as a whole (Wall & Lischeron, 1977).   

In the everyday life of contemporary businesses, issues concerned with human resource 
management, such as employee participation, do not draw significant attention. Therefore, in 
order to undercut operating costs, the upper management hierarchy often leads to the 
reduction of human capital. In other words, top level managers decide whether to cut salaries 
or to decrease money spent for employees’ training and development (Pessic et al, 2012).  

At this point, we should highlight that participation can be regarded as a strategic tool for 
achieving employee total involvement. This leads to the resolution of specific organizational 
problems to support strategic management decisions. In other words, current businesses can 
ensure a successful implementation of an effective strategic management approach, by 
linking every discrete employee to the overall strategic management process (Hit et al, 1999). 
It is worth clarifying that one of the main influences of the rise of participative management 
is the re-evaluation of the organizations structures and the redefinition of employee relations 
(Hyman & Mason, 1995).  

Strategy represents the organization’s ultimate goal broken down by certain discrete 
objectives. Contingency theories argue that the effectiveness of different organizational 
structures and practices depends basically on business strategy (Delery & Doty, 1996; Doty, 
Glick & Huber, 1993; Miles & Snow, 1978). In this study, we argue that an organization’s 
business strategy will be related to the amount of participation that it adopts. 

According to Wheelen & Hunger (2012), the basic elements of strategic management are: a) 
Assessment of internal and external environment, b) Strategy formulation, c) Strategy 
implementation and d) Evaluation and control. Additionally, the primary benefits of the 
strategic management can be briefly summarized as follows: a) Awareness of strategic vision 
for the organization, b) Attention to the factors that are strategically important and c) 
Assessment of the external environment. Other additional benefits include the improved 
organizational performance and the relationship between the external environment of the firm 
and its strategy, structure and its internal processes.  

 

2.2 Teamwork Performance  
The concept of team work can be outlined as “a group of people pooling their skills, talents, 
and knowledge, teams can often tackle complex and chronic problems and come up with 
effective, permanent solutions” (Scholtes, 1998). 
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Nowadays it is quite common that many firms and organizations are trying to improve the 
creativity of their workforce by organizing the employee’s competency to work successfully 
within a team environment. Katzenbach & Smith (2015) describe the concept “team” as “a 
small number of people with complementary skills who are committed to a common purpose, 
set of performance goals and approach, for which they hold themselves mutually 
accountable”.  
Parker & Williams (2001) claim that effective teamwork is driven by changes in structures 
and procedures that led to significant changes in work design (i.e. employees within the team 
are mutually dependent gaining more autonomy as a group). According to this argument, 
when completing a task, employees are more responsible and interact in an efficient way to 
support each other (van Mierlo et al., 2005). Effective teamwork leads employees to gain 
more opportunities on how to fulfill their labour tasks and organize their everyday working 
duties. Van Mierlo et al., (2005) also claim that the high level of individual and team 
autonomy come as a result of assigning increased tasks and responsibilities to the working 
group by the top level management. It is also worth mentioning that employee participation 
enhances team effort and leads to higher efficiency, effectiveness and productivity. Also, it 
reduces the operational cost and, finally, leads to greater dedication from the employee 
perspective (Doucouliagos, 1995). 

As a consequence, it is crucial for modern firms to constantly achieve their strategic goals in 
order to exceed competitors’ average performance. To obtain this target, team members need 
to agree on the common strategic goal which will provide the proper direction for future 
action. Moreover, constant management support is an indispensable key to success, as long as 
team building needs the proper selection, commitment, trust and cooperation. According to 
the previous analysis, employee participation and team work management approach 
contribute to the gradually improvement of modern firms, enhancing their overall effort of 
obtaining a competitive advantage. 

Based on Wheelwright (1989), when an enterprise obtain and mainly sustain a competitive 
advantage, it can be distinguished by the following characteristics: a) Participation support, b) 
Customers’ satisfaction, c) Product specialty, d) Core competence, e) Employees’ inspiration 
and f) Continued improvement process. 

 

2.3 Employee participation in decision making 
Modern firms use explicit strategic practices to engage employees in decision making process. 
Based on the existing literature, there is a vast majority of alternative models describing the 
strategy process. Specifically, De Wit & Meyer (2010), describe the strategy as a dynamic 
three stages process, namely: a) Analysis stage, b) Formulation stage and c) Implementation 
stage. Each stage requires different practices for employee participation and employee 
involvement.  

Considering the above classification, during the analysis stage manager’s ultimate objective 
is to examine the internal and the external environment of the firm. The result that will 
emerge will be the identification of the strengths and weaknesses of the internal environment 
in accordance with the opportunities and threats of the external environment. According to 
Porter (1980; 2008), the external environment contains information about the bargaining 
power of suppliers and buyers, competition between rivals, threats of substitution and barriers 
to entry. 
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In each of the aforementioned stages, upper management can use different practices in order 
to enhance employee participation but it is crucial to identify that all practices cannot be used 
in every stage.  

Specifically, the alternative methods that the executive officers can use in order to combine 
employee participation with the overall strategy are the following: a) consultative 
participation, b) employee ownership, c) representative participation, d) informal 
participation, e) employee involvement, f) employee involvement teams, g) work councils 
and employee board level representation and finally h) social media jam (Cotton et al, 1988; 
Lawler, 1994; Cabrera et al, 2003; Kleinknecht, 2014; Whittington, 2015; Bjelland & Wood, 
2008). 

 

3. Methodology  
The methodology applied in this section is based on Porter’s competitive five forces model 
(“Five Forces model”). By using this research tool, we will be able to assess the way that 
employee participation and team work performance influence competition stemmed from the 
five relevant forces. This model is widely known as a framework to analyze the way modern 
businesses develop their strategies (Porter, 1980; 1985). In other words, it enables a firm to 
compete with its rivals, so as to retain or increase its market share in the relevant market. 
Moreover, the Five Forces model is a “useful starting point for strategic analysis even where 
profit criteria may not apply” (Johnson, Scholes & Whittington, 2008).  

Five forces model focuses on the exploitation of market power and the intensity of existing 
competition in the industry and can be used to evaluate the main drivers of the strategic 
development process (Porter, 1996; Roney, 2004). The relevant model explores the five key 
areas that analyze and determine the competitiveness of an industry. These are the threat of 
entry, the threat of substitution, the bargaining power of customers; the bargaining power of 
suppliers and finally, the existing competition rivalry (see Figure 1). 
 

Figure 1: Porter’s Competitive Model of Five Forces (1979) 

 
This study assesses the contribution of employee participation and teamwork performance, 
taking into consideration the upper goal of modern businesses, namely the differentiation in 
the market. In this way competitive firms increase their profitability levels and reinforce 
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entrepreneurship. Under these circumstances, the objective of this paper is to identify how 
much attention has been given to the terms of employee participation and teamwork 
performance, as stimulants of competitive advantage. It is generally acknowledged that there 
is a downturn regarding the competitive advantage theory from the traditional strategic tools 
(i.e product and process technology, financial assets and resources, economies of scale, etc) 
toward newly established theories. These theories aim at the examination of the role of 
human resource management on the formulation of the competitive advantage.   

According to the requirements of this study, we consider that Porter’s five forces model 
constitutes a very useful tool for the upper management as far as the strategic management 
process is concerned.  

Before we carry on with the analysis, we should mention that“The Five Forces model”does 
not fully assess the resources and capabilities of a company and also its internal environment 
(Rivard, Raymond & Verreault, 2006). 

 

4. Factors that facilitate the competitive advantage 
Previous studies highlight the influence of human capital to macro-economic competitiveness 
and economic growth (see for example Krueger & Lindahl, 2001). Undoubtedly, in many 
successful firms the most valuable strategic asset to gaining market positioning, is not related 
only with marketing strategies, but also concerns the implementation of human factor 
practices as well. 

The work of Foudraine (2015) provides a framework outlining modern practices that 
companies can follow to include employee participation in different phases of the strategy 
process. Based on the seminal studies of Porter (1980; 1996), the competitive five forces 
model incorporates the essence of competitive strategy formulation as a way to link the 
company with its environment. We can also assume that the most effective way for a firm to 
increase its market share is to build an ideal relationship with its value-chain market 
participants (i.e customers, suppliers, firms with supplementary/complimentary products, new 
entrants and domestic rivals). 

This study also investigates the impact of employee participation on the formulation of a 
sustainable competitive advantage. We must argue that employees are the only “thinking” 
resource since they are characterized by attributes such as knowledge, abilities, experience, 
etc (Pessic et al, 2012). Moreover, it should be highlighted that in modern firms the key to 
improve competitiveness will be achieved through the cultivation of human resource 
knowledge and the abilities that enhance employee participation. Yussof & Ismail (2002) 
argue that the appropriate investments in human capital through higher education and 
professional training can lead to better capabilities for the employees. Besides, it is observed 
that members of the upper management take their strategic decisions based on information 
collected from suppliers, distributors, customers and competitors (Bosma, 2004). 

4.1 Threat of substitution 
The ‘threat of substitution’ refers to the ability of a product (or service) from another market 
to satisfy market demand in a more coherent way that an existing product cannot do. 
Specifically, it affects directly the competitive environment and influences the market 
player’s ability to achieve higher profitability. In other words, a substitute product offers 
close benefits to the customer similar with the product produced by the firms within the 
market. According to this definition, the threat of substitution implies a level of risk that a 
company must undertake in its effort to differentiate from the existing substitutes products.  
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This force includes various forms of competition, such as price competition (i.e price 
discrimination, volume or invoice discounts, fidelity rebates, etc), new product offerings, 
advertising campaigns and service improvements (Porter, 2008). We should refer that this 
factor can be influenced by specific parameters, such as the growth rate of the industry, the 
level of fixed costs or storage costs, the level of switching costs between competitors, the 
number of firms in the industry, the horizontal and vertical differentiation and finally the 
barriers to exit (Hubbard & Beamish, 2011; Slater & Olson, 2002; Johnson et al., 2008).  

Based on the above, we argue that the factors that influence the threat of substitutes are the 
switching costs between substitutes and also the buyers’ loyalty to buy substitutes (Hubbard 
& Beamish, 2011; Klemperer, 1995). 

Applying the Valuable, Rarity, Imitability, Organization framework (“VRIO”), managers can 
be helped in recognizing sources of competitive advantage (see Figure 2). Specifically, VRIO 
model constitutes a framework suitable for the analysis of a firm's larger strategic design. We 
can assume that when a firm has valuable and rare resources, can anticipate competitive 
advantage at least temporarily. We conclude that when the resources are valuable, rare and 
costly for other businesses to imitate, a firm can also expect sustainable competitive 
advantage, if organized appropriately (Barney & Hesterly, 2012). 
 

Figure 2: VRIO Model 

 
Source: Barney and Hesterly (2010). 

 
4.2 Threat of entry 
The ‘threat of new entrants’ in a market denotes how a potential competitor can easily enter 
the market and start competing effectively the incumbent company. It should be noted that 
industries facing low entry barriers, have specific characteristics, such as limited economies 
of scale, low level of product differentiation, non-significant capital requirements, absence of 
switching costs, limited cost advantages, etc. According to Porter (1979), the six most 
important barriers to entry are the following: a) Economies of scale, b) product differentiation, 
c) capital requirements, d) cost disadvantages, e) access to distribution channels and f) 
government policy.  
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Dominant firms in their efforts to deal with the level of existing competition must have 
flexibility toward the constantly changing needs of the market. Therefore, the imperative 
need to expand their activities, forces them to overwhelm the commercial, economical and 
political barriers looking for new markets to entry.  

According to Porter (1979), new entrants bring new capacity, willingness to gain market 
share compared with the other rivals, and also are characterized by substantial resources. The 
existence of structural barriers to entry mitigates effective competition by potential rivals in 
the market and therefore, affects the rivalry among existing competitors (Johnson et al, 2008). 
As a result, the lower the barriers to entry, the higher the threat of new entrants.  

In contrast to the manufacturing industry, in services sector employees’ characteristics are 
recognized as a vital part of the final product they produce (Heller et al, 1998). Generally, 
when a firm decides to enter the market, it conducts a thorough research along with a 
strategic management plan. The ultimate goal is to formulate the ideal strategy derived from 
careful competitor analysis to achieve its strategic goals.  

Based on the above, it is obvious that a company should be aware of potential competitor’s 
threat and the pressure by substitute products in order to analyze the globally market 
environment (Porter, 1985). 

In alignment with the aforementioned analysis, Hitt et al (2006) recognize that companies’ 
penetration to foreign markets cannot be achieved without utilizing high-quality employees’, 
since they represent the most important source of competitive advantage.  

  

4.3 Bargaining power of buyers 
The ‘bargaining power of buyers’ represents the strength that customers impose on an 
industry. When customers are in a strong position, they can put great pressure on the market 
and achieve better quality obtaining lower prices. It is worth mentioning that this force is 
severe when there are few buyers in the market possessing considerable market shares.  

Undoubtedly, the most significant part of customer relations is related with the added value 
that customers gain through the provision of excellent service and satisfaction. The 
bargaining power of customers is higher, if buyers are larger compared with the number of 
suppliers and are able to switch easily to another supplier (Slater & Olson, 2002). 

Globalised firms, in their effort to develop their business strategy, are systematically 
reorganizing their internal procedures in order to design an efficient business model. This 
model is a necessary tool to help them distinguish and gain competitive advantage over their 
rivals. The bargaining power of buyers refers to the pressure that consumers can put on 
businesses in terms of providing higher quality products, better customer service and lower 
prices. This power can be maximized when buyers establish consumer unions (Barney & 
Hesterly, 2012). It can be also argued that consumers may discipline firms directly through 
product boycotts and can also affect business strategy by exerting public pressure on 
regulators to intervene on their behalf (Hendel et al, 2017).  

The crucial issues that derived so far are the identification of customer needs, the detection of 
customer groups and the finding of the distinctive competencies in order to satisfy the target 
market. During the last decade, human resources and especially employees’ participation 
importance has been especially placed to the creation of value for customers. 

Empirical evidence has shown that employee participation is very important driver for 
analyzing the level of customer service. There is also a positive relationship between: a) 
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Employee fulfillment and customer satisfaction and b) Employee participation and employee 
satisfaction (Cabrera et al, 2001).  

 

4.4 Bargaining power of suppliers 
The ‘bargaining power of suppliers’ determines the strength that suppliers can exert over 
firms competing in an industry. Moreover, this factor analyses the pressure that suppliers can 
put on businesses as long as they can provide higher quality products which can lead to better 
customer service and lower prices. According to Porter (1979), “Powerful suppliers can 
squeeze profitability out of an industry unable to recover cost increases in its own prices”. 
The bargaining power of suppliers is maximized when there are few suppliers providing the 
same type of product. Moreover, it should be stressed that “The bargaining power of 
suppliers can be influenced by the size of the supplier, the number of suppliers, and the 
availability of alternative customers” (Slater & Olson, 2002). 

The bargaining power of suppliers affects the competitive environment and profit potential of 
the buyers. This factor constitutes one of the forces that shape the competitive landscape of 
an industry and helps determine its attractiveness. There are five major factors when 
determining the bargaining power of suppliers: a) Number of suppliers, b) Dependence of a 
supplier’s sale on a particular buyer, c) Switching cost, d) Availability of suppliers for 
immediate purchase, e) Forward integration by suppliers (Porter, 1980; 1985).  

We must argue that, when suppliers exert bargaining power, they put pressure on a company 
in certain ways (e.g imposing higher prices, adjusting the quality of the product, controlling 
availability and supply schedules). It is crucial to mention that when suppliers possess this 
bargaining power, they can affect the competitive environment and directly influence the 
level of profitability for a company (Porter, 1980).  

 

4.5 Existing competition rivalry 
The ‘existing competition rivalry’ is based on the level of price formulation, its differentiation 
and other important factors, such as customer service and unique advertising campaigns (Hitt 
et al, 1995).  

As mentioned above, employee participation can be regarded as a helpful mechanism that a 
firm must use in order to respond to the changes of the external turbulent environment. The 
main changes of the external environment can be classified as follows: a) pressure stemming 
from the existence of strategic threats, b) continuous technological improvements, c) 
increased number of competitors, and d) product obsolescence (Pessic et al, 2012). According 
to Lawler et al (1995), in a dynamic environment, globalized competition and constant 
pressures for greater performance are strongly interrelated to the adoption of employee 
involvement practices. In such a way, companies that operate in a highly competitive 
environment can maximize their profitability by making good use of employee participation 
(Doucouliagos, 1995; Miller & Monge, 1986).  

Due to the increasing use of information technology, all market participants have access to 
extensive information resources. This leads to a formation of new business models that 
change the notion for competition substantially (Dälken, 2014). Furthermore, we must argue 
that modern firms have better access to more information relevant with their customers, their 
suppliers or their competitors.  
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According to Cabrera et al (2001), the special characteristics of the external business 
environment (i.e level of competition, percentage of employees belonging to a trade union), 
influence the amount of employee participation. Moreover, this study reveals that the level of 
existing competition positively affects employee participation in an industry (Cabrera et al, 
2001). More specifically, firms that follow a cost leadership strategy emphasize cost control 
and efficiency, in order to be able to offer lower prices to their clients (Porter, 1980). One of 
the main factors that contribute to the overall costs is labor cost reduction. As a result, human 
resources can be regarded as a production ‘cost’ and therefore are closely monitored by the 
upper managers (Hyman & Mason, 1995). As far as employee participation is concerned, the 
time required for involving employees, for sharing information, will also be considered as an 
important cost for the organization (Cabrera et al, 2001). 

According to Porter (1980), the alternative strategy to cost leadership is the differentiation 
strategy. The latter is focused on the uniqueness of the product and the most common 
differentiation strategies are the following: a) superior product quality and b) excellent 
customer service. According to the existing literature, most quality improvement programs 
are based upon the premise that both increased sharing of information and participation in 
decision-making is positively related to product reliability and quality (see for example 
Beatty, 1991, Deming, 1986, Lawler et al, 1995). 

In other words, employee participation can be regarded as a competitive advantage strategy 
for the companies that, if used properly, may help them to tackle competition from the rival 
firms (Douglas Mc Gregor, 1960). During this stage, upper managers have to conduct 
competitive analysis and identify the strengths and weaknesses of the internal environment 
along with the opportunities and threats created by the external environment. 

 

5. Conclusions 
This study investigates the impact of employee participation on the formulation of a 
sustainable competitive advantage. Based on the above analysis, we argue that there is a 
positive influence of employee participation in a firm’s efficiency in its effort to obtain and 
sustain a competitive advantage. However, in practice, modern firms don’t take full 
advantage of a participative management approach. As previously mentioned, employees 
participation can support upper managers in their effort to deal with the opportunities and 
threats of the external business environment. 

It is evident that modern firms should focus their policy on a more participative approach, in 
order to take advantage of the benefits of employee involvement in the process of strategic 
management. Therefore, human factor should not be treated as an unnecessary cost burden 
but as the most important asset for the firm to dominate its existing rivals. It can also be 
regarded as a very important parameter in the development of the strategic decision-making 
process. Basically, through the employee participation in strategic decision making process, a 
business can reap the benefits of quality improvements and productivity increases. 

In this way, employees with different values and expertise should be encouraged to 
participate throughout the whole process of implementing strategic objectives. It is worth 
mentioning that this participative approach should be a part of a continuous development 
effort, aiming to embrace employees of all the departments into the procedure of designing 
and implementing strategic objectives.  

Under these circumstances, current businesses should continuously encourage employee’s 
involvement, create new knowledge and spread it throughout the company’s new products 

 
57

A. Oikonomou, SPOUDAI Journal, Vol.68 (2018), Issue 2-3, pp. 48-61



and processes. In such a way, human resources and especially employee participation and 
teamwork performance can be considered as very important factors of competitiveness. 

It is worth emphasizing that research and quantitative analysis examining the relationship 
between human resources and competitive advantage are limited, especially concerning the 
Porters’ Competitive five forces model and employee participation (Pessic et al, 2012). 

Based on the above, we conclude that effective teamwork and employee participation are the 
prime elements of a successful business playing a strategic key to reinforce entrepreneurship. 
By relating the five Forces model along with the principles of effective employee 
participation and teamwork, the business is reinforced in gaining a competitive advantage.  

 
Acknowledgments  
The author would like to thank the Editor-in-Chief Professor Evangelos Sambracos for giving 
her the opportunity to revise her work. Special thanks also go to an anonymous referee of this 
journal for providing useful comments and suggestions on an earlier version of this paper that 
enhanced its merit. All errors belong to the author. Usual disclaimer applies.      
 
 
References 

 
Audrestch D. & Thurik R., (2000), “Capitalism and democracy in the 21st century: from the managed 

to the entrepreneurial economy”, Journal of Evolutionary Economics, 10: pp. 17-34.  
Barney, J. B., & Hesterly, W. S. (2010), “VRIO Framework. In Strategic Management and 

Competitive Advantage”, (pp. 68–86). New Jersey: Pearson. 
Barney J. & Hesterly W., (2012), “Strategic Management and Competitive Advantage”, 5th Edition, 

Pearson. 
Bosma N., (2004), “The value of human and social investments for the business performance of 

startups”, Small Business Economics, 23, 227-236. 
Beatty R., (1991), “Total quality management and the human resources professional”, Perspectives 

in total compensation, Vol. 3, 1-6. 
Busck O., Knudsen H., & Lind J. (2010), “The transformation of employee participation: 

Consequences for the work environment”, Economic and Industrial Democracy 31(3): 285–305. 
Bjelland O. & Wood R., (2008), “An Inside View of IBM's' Innovation Jam”, MIT Sloan management 

review, 50(1), 32-40.  
Cabrera E., Cabrera A. & Ortega J. (2001), Working Paper 01-6, Business Economics Series 2, 

January 2001 
Cabrera E., Ortega J. & Cabrera Á., (2003), “An exploration of the factors that influence employee 

participation in Europe”, Journal of World Business, 38(1), 43-54. 
Carree M. & Thurik R., (2003), “The Impact of Entrepreneurship on Economic Growth”, Handbook 

of Entrepreneurship Research. Z. Acs and D. Audretsch, Springer US. 1: 437-471.   
Cotton J., Vollrath D., Froggatt K., Lengnick-Hall L., & Jennings K. (1988), “Employee participation: 

Diverse forms and different outcomes”, Academy of Management Review, 13(1), 8-22. 
Dälken F. (2014), “Are Porter’s Five Competitive Forces still Applicable? A Critical Examination 

concerning the Relevance for Today’s Business”, Bachelor Thesis, University of Twente, P.O. 
Box 217, 7500AE Enschede, The Netherlands. 

Davidsson, P., Delmar, F., & Wiklund, J. (2006), “Entrepreneurship and the Growth of Firms”, 
Cheltenham and Northampton, MA: Edward Elgar.  

Delery J. & Doty H. (1996), “Modes of theorizing in strategic human resource management: Tests of 
universalistic, contingency, and configurational performance predictions”, Academy of 
Management Journal, Vol. 39, no. 4, 802-835. 

 
58

A. Oikonomou, SPOUDAI Journal, Vol.68 (2018), Issue 2-3, pp. 48-61



Deming E., (1986), “Out of Crisis”, Cambridge, MA: MIT Center for Advanced Engineering Study. 
De Wit B. & Meyer R., (2010), “Strategy: process, content, context: an international perspective”, 

Cengage Learning EMEA. 
Doty H., Glick W. & Huber G., (1993), “Fit, equifinality and organizational effectiveness: A test of 

two configurational theories”, Academy of Management Journal, Vol. 36, no. 6, 1196-1250. 
Doucouliagos C. (1995), “Worker participation and productivity in labor-managed and participatory 

capitalist firms: A meta-analysis”, Industrial and Labor Relations Review, Vol. 49, no. 1, 58-77. 
Douglas Mc Gregor, (1960), “The Human Side of the Enterprise”, 25th Anniversary Printing, Mc 

Graw Hill. 
Foudraine J., (2015), “Practices to involve employees in the strategy process”, University of Twente, 

P.O. Box 217, 7500AE, 5th IBA Bachelor Thesis Conference, July 2nd, 2015, Enschede, The 
Netherlands 

Georgopoulos N., (2013), «Strategic Management», G. Benos Publishing, (In Greek). 
Gibson J., Ivanchevich L., Donnelly J. & Konopaske R. (2012), “Organizations: Behavior, Structure, 

Processes”, 14th edition, The McGraw-Hill Companies, Inc. 
Grant R. (2015), “Contemporary Strategy Analysis: Text and Cases”, Wiley, Ninth Edition. 
Heller F., Pusic E., Strauss G. & Wilpert B. (1998), “Organizational Participation: Myth and 

Reality”, Oxford: Oxford University Press. 
Hendel I., Lach S. & Spiegel Y., (2017), “Consumers’ activism: the cottage cheese Boycott RAND”, 

Journal of Economics. 48, (4): 972–1003 
Hitt R., Ireland D. & Hoskisson R., (1999), “Strategic Management, Competitiveness and 

Globalization”, South- Western College Publishing, 3rd Edition. 
Hitt A., Uhlenbruck K. & Shimizu K. (2006), “The importance of resources in the 

internationalization of professional service firms: the good, the bad, and the ugly”, Academy of 
Management Journal, 49(6), 1137-1157. 

Hubbard G. & Beamish P. (2011), “Strategic management: thinking, analysis, action”, Pearson 
Education Australia.  

Hunger D., Wheelen T., Hoffman N. & Bamford C. (2015), “Strategic Management and Business 
Policy Globalization, Innovation, and Sustainability”, Fourteenth Edition, Pearson Education, 
Inc. 

Hurrell J., (2005). Organizational stress intervention. In J. Barling, E.K. Kelloway, & M.R. Frone 
(Eds.), Handbook of work stress (pp. 623_645). Thousand Oaks, CA: Sage. 

Hyman J. & Mason B., (1995), “Managing Employee Involvement and Participation”, London: Sage. 
Irawanto D., (2015), “Employee participation in decision-making: Evidence from a state-owned 

enterprise in Indonesia”, Management, Vol. 20, 2015, 1, pp. 159-172 
Johnson G., Scholes K., & Whittington R. (2008), “Exploring corporate strategy: text & cases”, 

Pearson Education.  
Katzenbach R. J. & Smith K. D., (2015), “The Wisdom of Teams-Creating the High 
  Performance Organization”, Harvard Business Review Press, Boston, Massachusetts. 
Kleinknecht R., (2014), “Employee participation in corporate governance: Implications for company 

resilience”, European Journal of Industrial Relations, 17(1): 41–56. 
Klemperer P., (1995), “Competition when consumers have switching costs: An   overview with 

applications to industrial organization, macroeconomics, and international trade”, The Review 
of Economic Studies, 62(4), 515-539. 

Krueger A. & Lindahl M., (2001), “Education for growth: why and for whom?”, Journal of Economic 
Literature, 39, 1101-36. 

Lawler E., (1994), “Total quality management and employee involvement: are they compatible?”, 
The Academy of Management Executive, 8(1), 68-76.  

 
59

A. Oikonomou, SPOUDAI Journal, Vol.68 (2018), Issue 2-3, pp. 48-61



Lawler E., Mohrman S. and Ledford G. (1995), “Creating High Performance Organizations”, San 
Francisco: Jossey-Bass. 

Marchington M., (2005), “Employee involvement: Patterns and explanations”, In: Harley, B, Hyman, 
J, Thompson, P (eds) Ramsay Participation and Democracy at Work: Essays in Honour of Harvie 
Ramsay. New York: Palgrave, pp. 20–37. 

Mayo A., (2001), “The human value of the enterprise, Valuing People as Assets- Monitoring, 
Measuring, Managing”, Nicholas Brealey Publishing, London. 

Miles R. & Snow C. (1978), “Organizational Strategy, Structure and Process”, New York: McGraw-
Hill. 

Nielsen K. & Randall R., (2012), “The importance of employee participation and perceptions of 
changes in procedures in a teamworking intervention”, Work & Stress Vol. 26, No. 2, April_June 
2012, 91_111. 

Parker S., & Williams H. (2001). Effective teamworking: Reducing the psychosocial risks. Norwich: 
HSE Books. 

Pessic M., Milic V. & Stankovic J. (2012), “Application of VRIO Framework for Analyzing Human 
Resources’ Role in Providing Competitive Advantage”, Book of Proceedings – Tourism and 
Management Studies International Conference Algarve, vol.2. 

Pfeffer J., (1994), “Competitive Advantage Through People, Unleashing the Power of the Workforce”, 
Harvard Business School Press, Boston, Massachusetts. 

Pollalis Y., (2004), “Strategic Management: Cases Studies in Competitiveness & Globalization 
(textbook by Hitt, M., Ireland, R., Hoskisson, International Thomson Publishing)”, Adaptation of 
book for Greece, Ellin Publishing, Athens, Greece. 

Porter M., (1979), “How competitive forces shape strategy”, Harvard Business Review, March/April. 
Porter M., (2008), “The five competitive forces that shape strategy”, Harvard Business Review, 

January 2008  
Porter M., (1980), “Competitive Strategy”, New York: Free Press. 
Porter M., (1985), “Competitive Advantage: Creating and Sustaining Superior Performance”, New 

York: Free Press. 
Porter M., (1987), “From Competitive Advantage to Corporate Strategy”, Harvard Business Review, 

May-June, 43-59. 
Porter M., (1996), “What is strategy?”, Published November.  
Rivard S., Raymond L. & Verreault D. (2006), “Resource-based view and competitive strategy: An 

integrated model of the contribution of information technology to firm performance”, Journal of 
Strategic Information Systems, 15(1): 29-50. 

Roney C. (2004), “Strategic management methodology: generally accepted principles for 
practitioners, guidelines for strategists”, Westport, CT: Praeger Publishers. 

Scarnati J. (2001), “On becoming a team player”, Team Performance Management: An international 
Journal, Vol.7 No.1. 

Schein E.H (1988), “Process Consultation: Its role in Organizational Development”, Vol.1, Addison-
Wesley, Reading, MA. 

Scholtes P., Joiner B. & Streibel B., (2003), “The Team Handbook”, Third  Edition, Oriel A 
Sam Group Company. 

Senior B. & Swails S., (2004), “The dimensions of management team performance: a repertory grid 
study”, International Journal of Productivity and Performance Management, Vol. 53 No.4. 

Slater S. & Olson E. (2002), “A fresh look at industry and market analysis”, Business Horizons, 45(1), 
15-22.  

 
60

A. Oikonomou, SPOUDAI Journal, Vol.68 (2018), Issue 2-3, pp. 48-61



Stonehouse G., Hamill J., Campbell D. & Purdie T. (2000), “Global and Transnational Business, 
Strategy and Management”, John Wiley and Sons. 

Twomey K. & Kleiner H.B. (1996), “Teamwork: the essence of the successful organization”, Team 
Performance Management: An International Journal, Vol.2 No.1. 

Yussof I. & Ismail R. (2002), “Human Resource Competitiveness and Inflow of Foreign, Direct 
Investment to the Asian Region”, Asia-Pacific Development Journal, 9(1), June. 

Wall T. & Lischeron J. (1977),“Worker participation, A critique of the literature and some fresh 
evidence”, Mc Graw Hill Company Limited, UK. 

Wheelen T. & Hunger D. (2012), “Strategic Management and Business Policy: Toward Global 
Sustainability” (13th Edition). 

Wheelwright S. (1989), “International Handbook of Production and Operations Management”, 
Cassell Educational, London. 

Whittington R. (2015), “The massification of strategy”, British Journal of Management, 26(S1), S13-
S16. 

Van Mierlo, H., Rutte, C., Kompier, M., & Dooreward, H. (2005), “Self-managing teamwork and 
psychological well-being: Review of a multilevel research domain”, Group & Organization 
Management, 30, 211_235. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
61

A. Oikonomou, SPOUDAI Journal, Vol.68 (2018), Issue 2-3, pp. 48-61


	Marchington M., (2005), “Employee involvement: Patterns and explanations”, In: Harley, B, Hyman, J, Thompson, P (eds) Ramsay Participation and Democracy at Work: Essays in Honour of Harvie Ramsay. New York: Palgrave, pp. 20–37.
	Mayo A., (2001), “The human value of the enterprise, Valuing People as Assets- Monitoring, Measuring, Managing”, Nicholas Brealey Publishing, London.



