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An innovative approach for estima -
ting bank production function cha -
ra cteristics

Paraskevi V. Boufounou

Keywords: Cost Function, Banking
Pro ducts, Economies of Scale, Eco -
no   mies of Scope, Efficiency.
JEL Classifications: C81, D20, G21,
M11.

An innovative method for estimating
bank production function chara cte -
ristics is pre sen ted by  means of a new
approach for defining and measuring
bank products. An eco no me tric mo -
del of a Trans-logarithmic Cost Fun -
ction is estimated using a major Gre -
ek Bank’s branch cross-sectional data
and its production characteristics are
evaluated. Finally, policy impli cations
suggested by the above model for
improving bank’s efficiency in terms
of stru ctural reforms on branch size
and product mix are assessed.

Human resource education and con -
cepts supported by the trainers of
adult learners: A case study

Vassiliki Brinia
Konstantinos Roussakis

Keywords: Adults education, Adults
edu ca tors, Vocational training.
JEL Classifications: Ι210, J240.

This paper aims presenting the con -
cepts supported by the trainers of adult
learners. These specific con ce pts will
be reflecting the prevailing situation as
far as the im ple men tation of diverse
programmes on the adult Learners
Education are concerned, as well as the
way in which this im ple mentation is
per ceived, experienced and interpreted
by the trainers the m selves via their
daily teaching practice. The research
methodology used, was the qualitative
one while the col le ction of the data was
realised via the research technique of
the interview which was applied to a
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«con veni ent»/«avai lable» sample, con -
sisting of twelve both male and female
trainers of a Continuous Vocational
Training (CVT) Programme. Via the
in divi dual semi-structured interviews,
the concepts of the CVT trainers were
thoroughly investigated focusing on
their role, the re qui red knowledge they
should dispose of, their skills and
attitudes, so that they can effectively
correspond to their role as well as the
content of their educational work in -
cluding the tea ching techniques im -
plemented. The analysis of content was
used as an elaboration method of the
interview data. The finds of the re -
search revealed that the CVT trai ners
question the teacher-centred mo del of
teaching and con sider the student-
centred model as the most appropriate
in the context of which they assu me a
multi-dimensional role. The di men -
sions mentioned comprise the ones of
the ani mator, the faci litator, the coor -
dinator and the con sultant. These con -
cepts comply with the con te mpo rary
role of the adult learners’ trai ner, as the
latter is des cribed both by the greek
and inter national bibliography.

Attitudes towards the use of In for -
mation and Communication Techno -
logies (ICT) at work: Findings from
the health care sector in Greece

Athanassios Vozikis
Maria Ypofanti
Ioannis Papadopoulos

Keywords: Information and Com mu -

nication Technologies (ICT), Heal th -
care, Statistical Analysis.  
JEL Classifications: I10, O32, C10.  

The aim of our study is to investigate
the re la tionship between several de -
mographic factors and the attitudes of
personnel towards the use of In for -
mation and Communication Techno -
logies (ICT) at work. Our random
sample con sisted of administrative,
medical and nursing personnel from
three  Public Hospitals (total 223
employees), aged 39 (± 19). The data
were collected using the following
instru ments: 1) Questionnaire of de -
mographic ele ments and 2) Que stio -
nnaire «16-19 Computer Attitude’s
Scale» as they were adjusted to fit the
needs of this study. The research fin -
dings indicate that the employees who
use ICT show more positive attitudes
towards new techno logies, possibly due
to the fact that they un der stand the
benefits that will exist for their work
through a computerized infor mation
system. The new employees are more
fa miliar with ICT techno logies, while
the more complex spe cialties consider
the use of com pu terized information
systems im por tant aid to make their
work more ef fective, in contrast to ol -
der workers as well as employees who
have re ceived only primary education.

The role of crowding out pursuit of
fiscal policy and the case of the
Greek economic crisis

Sotirios Theodoropoulos
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Keywords: Fiscal policy, Crowding
out, Ri car dian equivalence, Risk pre -
mium, Private in vestment.
JEL Classifications: E43, E62, E63,
H63.

The issue of the crowding out of fiscal
policy advises than an increase in
government debt reaching high levels,
reduces national saving, raises in te rest
rates, crowds out private in ves tment
and reduces future output. On this
issue is mainly centered the con tro -
versy between monetarists and Key -
nesians, debated for ma ny years. Also,
substantial empirical research has

been devoted testing the crowding out
of private economic activity by public
economic activity, focusing on the va -
lidity of Ricardian equivalence hypo -
thesis. By this paper we ex plore the
channels and mechanisms through
which this phenomenon takes place,
also its arising con se quences under
EMU’s en viro n ment and strongly
affected fiscal policy fra mework. We
also consider this as a proper theo -
retical instrument, sui table for in ves ti -
ga tion in the case of current greek
economic crisis, where the private
sector faces a severe and multi di men -
sional crowding out by public sector.
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